
 

                                 

 

MessageSolution Continues its Innovation in Email Server 

Migration Technology,  Reduces Migration Time By 75% from 

GroupWise or Domino to Exchange                                                                                 

 

Las Vegas, Nevada, November 2, 2010, and Silicon Valley, California -- 

MessageSolution, Inc., the global technology leader in email, file systems, and 

SharePoint/Quickr archiving for electronic discovery, litigation support, 

compliance, storage management, and email server migrations, today unveils the 

next-generation in email server migration technology at  Microsoft 

WinConnections Expo 2010.   

MessageSolution Enterprise Email Migration System delivers high speed email 

platform migration and  saves 75% of the time needed  to complete the email 

server migration process from GroupWise or Domino to Exchange compared to 

the time required by other migration vendors. 

“MessageSolution’s breakthrough email platform migration technology 

revolutionizes email server migrations, maximizes MessageSolution migration 

capacity, and saves 75% of the project time competitors’ migration systems 

require,” said Kevin McInerney, Global Marketing Strategist at MessageSolution. 

“Organizations of all sizes, including enterprises with tens of thousands of email 

users or SME with hundreds of email users, can benefit from MessageSolution’s 

high speed migration system”. 

With the traditional migration approach, organizations performing email platform 

migration often face a time and resource-consuming task . MessageSolution 

migration technology establishes an industry milestone  by completing  high-

speed email migration processes in approximately 25% of the time required by 

traditional migration products. 

MessageSolution’s migration and archiving multi-functional technologies can also 

help organizations with both email migration and email archiving multi-project 

requirements. Enterprise customers that utilize  traditional migration and 



 

                                 

 

archiving solutions frequently find it takes months to complete the first step 

(migration), then an equal amount of time to complete the second step (archiving), 

concluding with the final step (stubbing when necessary). This three-stage 

project can ultimately turn into a year-long project, imposing at least two sets of 

heavy software licensing and engineering service costs. MessageSolution 

Enterprise Migration System delivers email server migration, email archiving, 

indexing and stubbing in an all-in-one process, saving project time and 

significantly reducing cost. 

MessageSolution Enterprise Migration System also helps organizations 

‘ migration requirements for various environments including BPOS, SharePoint, 

GoogleApps, etc. 

As a Microsoft Gold Partner, MessageSolution will be exhibiting at 

WinConnections 2010 in the exhibition hall at booth # 423 at the Mandalay Bay 

Convention Center from November 1 – 4, in Las Vegas, Nevada. 

 
About MessageSolution, Inc. 
MessageSolution is the global technology leader in email, file system, and SharePoint archiving 
for electronic discovery, compliance,  content storage management, and email server 
migrations. With products and services delivered both on-premise and as Software as a Service 
(SaaS), MessageSolution enables organizations to mitigate risk, reduce costs and storage 
requirements, optimize server performance, and comply with industry and federal regulations. 
Based in Silicon Valley, California, MessageSolution maintains operations in North America, 
Europe, and Mainland China, along with distribution channels in Europe, Africa, Australia, and 
Asia Pacific. 
 
MessageSolution Enterprise Email Archive, Enterprise File Archive,  Enterprise SharePoint 
Archive, and Enterprise Migration System are on-premise solutions and Software as a Service 
(SaaS) archiving services implemented for organizations across all industries, including finance, 
health care, education, manufacturing, government agencies and non-profit organizations 
worldwide. MessageSolution software frees IT administrators from daily maintenance and 
increases overall employee productivity. For more information, visit 
http://www.MessageSolution.com. 
 
MessageSolution is actively working with partners around the world to work with global clients of 
all sizes. Please visit our web site for more information on the Global Partner Network Program. 
 
What Differentiates MessageSolution Products 
On-premise and SaaS customers continually emphasize MessageSolution products' excellent 
overall performance, support of all major email servers, and ease of use combined with a rich 
feature set. MessageSolution provides sub-second data retrieval, an intuitive interface, and ease 



 

                                 

 

of deployment and maintenance. MessageSolution's intelligent back-end design significantly 
reduces installation requirements, backup time, and the need for technical support. 
 
MessageSolution Enterprise Email Archive™ deftly manages petabytes of data daily, a powerful 
enterprise archiving solution. Electronic discovery and litigation support are empowered by the 
archive’s built-in search engine, which searches through millions of emails within seconds across 
global locations and data centers. Users can access their archive through their email client, 
browser, or BlackBerry. 
 
In the first quarter of 2009, MessageSolution became the first archiving vendor in the market to 
deliver a true 64-bit application that runs on a 64-bit OS machine.  
 
MessageSolution delivers the industry’s highest enterprise-level scalability and holds the industry 
record of archiving tens of thousands of users on one single MessageSolution archive server, 5-8 
times over competitions. Competitive vendors archive on average 3,000-5,000 users on a single 
archive server, much less than MessageSolution archiving system’s scalability and flexibility. A 
high in-process compression rate combined with Single Instance Storage (SIS) de-duplication of 
message, attachment and file archiving slows archive storage growth.  
 
MessageSolution Enterprise Archive Suite™ further reduces organizations' storage costs by 
using only 25-30% of the original mail server storage space for live content archiving. 
MessageSolution's products support all Latin-based languages, as well as all character-based 
languages, such as Japanese and Chinese.  
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